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Over the last decade sports tourism has seen rapid changes, one such growth area has been in the 
area of mass participatory sporting events (MPSE). MPSE attract participants who travel to 
participate in events such as marathons and triathlons. MPSE now play a role in promoting a 
destination, however their potential in terms of destination development in Ireland is generally 
unrealised.  

 

The research project will identify the benefits of MPSE for tourism destination development by 
analysing the participant’s demographics and their direct economic expenditure, it will evaluate the 
destination and event attributes which are considered most important by the participant and it will 
explore the current levels of collaboration that currently exists between MPSE organisers and 
destination marketing organisations. The research design will use a mixed method approach of 
quantitative and qualitative methods, it will include surveys and interviews. Five purposive 
handpicked MPSE have been chosen for the research project. A pilot study has been conducted on 
the 2015 Tralee International Marathon. The next stage of the research project is to develop the 
qualitative research methodology with quantitative data collection to commence in May with the 
Killarney Marathon. 

 

Due to the lack of in depth research in Ireland the potential economic and tourism benefits of mass 
participatory sporting events to destinations may not be fully understood by tourism 
planners/providers and event organisers. This research project will assist in filling this research gap. 
The research project will assist all stakeholders in identifying the factors necessary to maximise the 
potential of MPSE for tourism destination development and assist in the best use of state funding. 
The research project will allow tourism planners and event organisers develop a coherent marketing 
strategy and help them identify future trends. 
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Background 

Sports tourism is emerging as a very significant segment of the global tourism market (Tourist 
Review 2010). Of particular interest are mass participatory sporting events (MPSE) (Miller and 
Washington 2012; Coleman and Ramchandani 2010; Kotze 2006). MPSE attract participants to 
events such as marathons and triathlons (Weed & Bull 2004; Getz 2008). MPSE are now being 
classified as “serious leisure” (Smith et al 2010). Shipway and Jones (2008) propose MPSE such as 
marathons can be classified as “serious sport tourism”, where participants now incorporate their 
enthusiasm for physical exercise into their holiday plans. 

 

Applying the 2006 Events Tasmania Events Hierarchical Model (cited in Bowdin et al 2011), MPSE 
can be grouped into three main areas, MPSE of state significance, MPSE of regional significance and 
MPSE of local community interest. MPSE of state and regional significance generate the most 



tourism potential (Weed and Bull 2004). MPSE now play a role in promoting a destination (Reese 
2008), however their potential in terms of destination development is generally unrealised (Koo et al 
2014; Hallman and Breuer 2010; Kim et al 2010).  

 

MPSE participants are desirable targets for tourism planners and advertisers due to their 
demographic profiles (Georgiadas 2010) and as a result MPSE have received increased attention 
from researchers over the last decade (Wicker et al 2012; Getz and McConnell 2011;  Phelps and 
Dickson 2010). The Federation of Irish Sport (2014) proposes that participatory sporting events have 
an important and vital role to play in the development of any future tourism policy in Ireland.  

 

Aim and Objectives 

The aim of this research project is to identify the factors necessary to maximise the potential of mass 
participatory sporting events for tourism destination development.  

The research project will: 

 Evaluate the destination and event attributes which are considered most important by the 
participant. 

 Explore the levels of collaboration that currently exists between MPSE organisers and destination 
marketing organisations (DMO’S) 

 Analyse the participants’ demographics and their direct economic expenditure. 
 

Method  

This research uses a mixed method approach including surveys and interviews. A purposive 
(Denscombe 2007) handpicked sample of five mass participatory sporting events has been chosen 
for this research project. They include three road running events, an adventure race and a triathlon. 
Purposive sampling allows researchers to pick subjects that represent features that they are 
interested in as part of their research to produce the most valuable data (Getz and Fairley 2004; 
Silverman 2000).  

 

The survey which will be carried out on participants of the above events largely consists of two main 
elements, an economic impact assessment and an evaluation of destination attributes. For the 
purpose of the economic impact assessments (EIA), only the direct economic impacts will be 
measured using methods outlined by Event Impacts (2015) and Leisure Industries Research Centre 
(2001). UK Sport (2004) recommends measuring direct economic impacts rather than indirect 
economic impacts when comparing sporting events. Event Impacts (2015b) a consortium of UK-
based sporting organisations and DMO’s caution that economic multipliers should only to be used by 
professional research bodies that are skilled in working with complex economic data. 

 

For the purpose of the EIA in this pilot study the population was defined as any participant from 
outside the county of the host destination, as they represent new money into the local economy 
(Sports Marketing Surveys 2011; Turco et al 2002). A Likert scale is being used to assess the 
perceived importance of 19 host destination and event attributes as outlined by Kaplanidou et al 
(2012) and Smith et al (2010). The 2015 Tralee International Marathon has been used to pilot the 
questionnaire.  

 



Semi-structured interviews will be conducted with the five race directors and representatives of 
local DMO’s. The interview process will explore the level of interaction between DMO’s and event 
organisers as regards to destination marketing, MPSE marketing, media management strategies and 
the use of website links. The interview structure and topics have been based on similar previous 
research (Devine et al 2010; Sun 2007; Getz and Fairley 2004). 

Results 

The data from the pilot study showed that The 2015 Tralee International Marathon attracted just 
over 950 race participants. 36% were non-local participants. 88% of respondents surveyed said the 
marathon was their primary reason for visiting Tralee.  

 

Economic Impact 

The event generated a direct economic impact of €78,000. Accommodation and Food was the 
largest expenditure. Tourism attractions and entertainment were the lowest (See table one). 

Table 1: Direct spending activity  

Category 
Expenditure 
per bed-night 
(€) 

Average 
number 
of bed 
nights 

Expenditure 
per-trip (€) 

Number of 
non-local 
participants 

Total 
Expenditure 
(€) 

Accommodation 

 
58 1.50 82.50 331 27,307.50 

Food & Drinks 

 
48 1.50 72 331 23,832 

Retail Shopping 

 
20 1.50 30 331 9.930 

Local 
Transportation 

 

21 1.50 31.50 331 10,426.50 

Tourist 
Attractions 

 

2 1.50 3 331 993 

Entertainment 

 
11 1.50 16.50 331 5,461 

Total Direct 
Spending 
Activity 

 

€160 1.50 €235.5 331 €77,953.00 

 

  



Demographics 

The average age group of non-local participants was between 34 and 44 years, with 59% holding a 
degree, 47% of non-local participants earned over €50,000 (see figure one) 

 

Figure 1: Yearly gross income  

 

 

Level of Importance of destination and event attributes  

The level of event organisation, accommodation availability and the destination of the event were 
ranked the highest attributes, while the level of competition and retail shopping were ranked 
amongst the lowest attributes (See table two).  

 

Table 2: Level of importance of destination and event attributes  

Rank Attribute Mean Standard Deviation 

1 Level of Organisation 4.21 0.901 

2 Destination of the event 4 0.816 

3 Accommodation availability 3.8 1.009 

4 Level of support on the route 3.74 1.093 

5 Accommodation standard 3.61 1.036 

6 Quality of the medal & t-shirt 3.58 1.331 

7 Registration fee 3.52 1.042 

8 Scenic attractions on the route 3.48 1.221 

9 Dining/Food 3.46 0.958 

10 Infrastructure & transportation 3.27 1.169 

11 Likelihood of good weather 3.25 1.272 

12 Status of the event 3.12 1.179 

13 Sightseeing opportunities 2.81 1.2 

14 Local sports facilities & activities 2.64 1.243 

15 Level of competition 2.62 1.205 
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16 Availability of tourist information 2.61 1.216 

17 Retail Shopping 2.15 1.075 

16 Entertainment (cinema, theatre) 2.15 1.129 

19 Nightlife 2.09 1.14 

Note: 1 = not at all important and 5 = been extremely important 

 

Conclusion  

The findings of the pilot confirm the findings of (Coleman and Ramchandani 2010; Smith et al 2010) 
that MPSE could be potentially used as a method of attracting attention to a particular geographic 
location. The majority of non-local participants said the marathon was their primary reason for 
visiting Tralee.  

 

The high educational levels of participants illustrates that the majority of respondents come from 
the high socio-economic sector. This combined with the high level of income earned by respondents 
demonstrates that MPSE participants are a desired demographic sector of the tourist market.  

 

The data shows that most visitors failed to visit tourist attractions at the event as only 3% of visitor 
expenditure was attributed to tourist attractions. This could indicate that tourism providers are not 
obtaining the maximum leverage from the marathon. The next stage of the research project is to 
start the quantitative data collection and develop the qualitative element of methodology. 
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